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GENERAL PLAN DESIGNATION: 
 SITE:   AE (Agricultural Exclusive) Designation 
  
 SURROUNDING: AE (Agricultural Exclusive) Designation 
           

ZONING: 
 SITE:   ARE-40 (Agricultural, Rural, Exclusive, 40-acre) District 

 
            SURROUNDING: ARE-40 (Agricultural, Rural, Exclusive, 40-acre) District  

 
LAND USE: 

 SITE: Row Crop Agriculture 
 
 SURROUNDING:   Rural Residential and Orchards 

 
SIZE OF PROPERTY:      210.5 acres  

  
ACCESS:                          The property is accessed by Road 4. 
 
BACKGROUND AND PRIOR ACTIONS: 

Prior to this Time Extension request, CAL SPV applied for a conditional use permit 
#2010-015 which was approved in January of 2011 with its corresponding Mitigated 
Negative Declaration #2010-020. 

 
ORDINANCES/POLICIES: 

Madera County Code 18.58 outlines allowed uses within the ARE-40 (Agricultural, Rural, 
Exclusive, 40-acres) zone district 

 
Madera County General Plan Policy Document (page 7) outlines the allowable uses 
within the AE (Agricultural Exclusive) designation 
 
Madera County Code 18.94.180 outlines the requirements for conditional use permits to 
allow solar farms 
 
Section 18.92.060.B of the Zoning Ordinance outlines the procedure for Time Extensions 

 
PROJECT DESCRIPTION: 

This project proposal is for a one year time extension of a conditional use permit to allow 
the development of a 20 megawatt (MW) photovoltaic solar facility, inverter buildings, 
sub-station, bathroom structure, and parking lot. The project site consists of 210.5 acres. 
The project includes agricultural use in the aisles between solar panels and other areas 
left uncovered by the panels. The application states that dry farming or she grazing 
would be performed in the open areas. Approximately 160-170 acres of the total 210.5 
acres would be utilized for agricultural purposes. The solar panels are proposed to be 
spread across the entire project site, with aisles in between for maintenance purposes. 
The solar panels would completely cover 38.7 acres of the project site. 
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ANALYSIS: 

The Zoning Ordinance, Section 19.92.060(B) states that a conditional use permit may be 
terminated if it is not used within two years of the date of approval, and shall be voidable, 
unless written time extensions are applied for and approved prior to permit expiration. 
The granting of a time extension or the voiding of the conditional use permit must occur 
by Planning Commission action in a noticed public hearing. Time extensions may be 
granted or conditionally granted provided: 
 

1. Each extension will be for a one year period of time; and 
2. The maximum number of extensions will not exceed an additional total of three 

years. 
 
Prior to the expiration date of the permit, the applicant came to the Planning Department 
noting that negotiations were underway for a change in the ownership for the project. In 
lieu of these changes the department granted additional time to allow the transfer to take 
place before they filed for their time extension. The new applicant, Iberdrola 
Renewables, was advised to submit a letter requesting a time extension after a meeting 
with department staff, along with the appropriate fee. 
 
If the commission grants this time extension, the applicant could in the future request up 
to two more extensions, thereby postponing development up to August 2017. To receive 
additional extensions the applicant must apply to and receive approval from the Planning 
Commission each year. 
 
The project has been reviewed and it has been determined that there have been no 
changes to development standards for the area, or other changes that would change the 
manner in which a new application at that site would be considered. It is likely that if the 
time extension was not granted, and the applicant reapplied for a conditional use permit, 
it would result in the same conditions of approval. 

 
The project was routed to all parties thought to be impacted from the installation of a 20 
megawatt (MW) photovoltaic solar facility, inverter buildings, sub-station, bathroom 
structure, and parking lot. 

 
WILLIAMSON ACT: 

The parcel is subject to a Williamson Act (Agricultural Preserve) contract, but has filed a 
Notice of Non-Renewal. Conditions of approval for CUP#2010-015 requires the subject 
parcel(s) to be removed from the Williamson Act Contract.  

 
GENERAL PLAN CONSISTENCY STATEMENT: 

The subject property is designated AE (Agricultural Exclusive) by the General Plan. The 
property is zoned ARE-40 (Agricultural, Rural, Exclusive -40 Acre District). The zone 
district is consistent with the general plan designation of AE which allows for various 
public and quasi-public uses, which energy generation would be. In addition, the project 
is consistent with General Plan Policy Goal 3.J to provide “efficient and cost-effective 
utilities.” The proposed solar facilities will provide a local, renewable energy source that 
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will help Madera County become more self-sustaining, economically viable, and increase 
environmental conditions. 

 
RECOMMENDATION: 

The analysis provided in this report supports approval of the time extension for CUP 
#2010-015 with its corresponding Conditions of Approval from CUP #2010-015. 

 
 ATTACHMENTS: 
  

1. Exhibit A, General Plan Map 
 2. Exhibit B, Zoning Map 
 3. Exhibit C, Assessor=s Parcel Map 
 4. Exhibit D, Site Plan 
 5. Exhibit E, Aerial Map 
 6. Exhibit F, Topography Map 
 7. Exhibit G, Approved CUP#2010-015 Staff Report 
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